
 

 
 
 
DATE:  BID TITLE & REFERENCE: 
September 14, 2016    Art Paper, Bid #170205 
 
DESCRIPTION OF PURCHASE: 
 

An annual pricing agreement to provide art paper as stocked and distributed by the Central 
Warehouse.  Eighty-one (81) items bid; seventy-five (75) items are awarded.  Bid award to the lowest 
bidder that met both bid specifications and administrative concerns.  Administrative concerns include 
administrative cost savings by using one vendor, minimum buy requirements that the District could 
not meet if the bid was awarded to multiple vendors and greater buying power/leverage with one 
vendor that is in the best interest of the District. 

    
Effective Dates: October 1, 2016 through September 30, 2017. 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
  
REQUESTED BY: 

 

 Central Warehouse 
 
    
SUPPLIER NAME:      ITEMS AWARDED:  ESTIMATED ANNUAL EXPENDITURE: 
 

Pyramid School Products, Tampa, FL    75    $65,000.00 
    
 
AMOUNT OF PURCHASE: FUNDING SOURCE: 
  

$65,000.00 Est. / Yr.           General Fund (1110)  
       

   
METHOD OF PROCUREMENT: 

 

ECSD Bid             Responses Received:  7      Bids Rejected: 1 
                          

  
DATE AND TIME POSTED: 

 
     September 14, 2016, 9:45 am Central Time 
 
 
9500PUR101 (11/10) Retention - 5 Years 

 
THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY 

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT 
75 North Pace Boulevard  

Pensacola, FL  32505 
 

BID AWARD NOTICE 



Tuesday, August 30, 2016 2:00 PM

** F=Florida Business; O=Out of State Business

Bid Item #/Description 

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F ARP Industries $0.88 $0.88 MO, 1 $0.88 $0.88 MO, 1 $0.88 $0.88 MO, 1 $0.88 $0.88 MO, 1

F DGS Educational Products $2.95 $2.95 $2.95 $2.95 $2.95 $2.95 $2.95 $2.95

F Pyramid School Products $0.92 $0.92 MO, 1 $0.92 $0.92 MO, 1 $0.92 $0.92 MO, 1 $0.92 $0.92 MO, 1

O School Specialty 5% $0.89 $0.93 $0.89 $0.93 $0.89 $0.93 $0.89 $0.93

O S&S Worldwide 5% NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

F Smith Office & Computer $0.88 $0.88 MO, 1 $0.88 $0.88 MO, 1 $0.88 $0.88 MO, 1 $0.88 $0.88 MO, 1

Bid Item #/Descripton

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F ARP Industries $0.88 $0.88 MO, 1 $0.88 $0.88 MO, 1 $0.88 $0.88 MO, 1 $0.88 $0.88 MO, 1

F DGS Educational Products $2.95 $2.95 $2.95 $2.95 $2.95 $2.95 $2.95 $2.95

F Pyramid School Products $0.92 $0.92 MO, 1 $0.92 $0.92 MO, 1 $0.92 $0.92 MO, 1 $0.92 $0.92 MO, 1

O School Specialty 5% $0.89 $0.93 $0.89 $0.93 $0.89 $0.93 $0.89 $0.93

O S&S Worldwide 5% NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

F Smith Office & Computer $0.88 $0.88 MO, 1 $0.88 $0.88 MO, 1 $0.88 $0.88 MO, 1 $0.88 $0.88 MO, 1

Bid Item #/Description 

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F ARP Industries $0.88 $0.88 MO, 1 $0.88 $0.88 MO, 1 $0.88 $0.88 $30.14 $30.14 MO, 1

F DGS Educational Products $2.95 $2.95 $2.95 $2.95 $2.95 $2.95 $32.44 $32.44 MO, 2

F Pyramid School Products $0.92 $0.92 MO, 1 $0.92 $0.92 MO, 1 $0.92 $0.92 MO, 1 $29.95 $2.95 MO, 1

O School Specialty 5% $0.89 $0.93 $0.89 $0.93 $0.89 $0.93 $29.25 $30.71

O S&S Worldwide 5% NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

F Smith Office & Computer $0.88 $0.88 MO, 1 $0.88 $0.88 MO, 1 $0.88 $0.88 MO, 1 $30.00 $30.00 MO, 1

**
FL. 

Pref. 

Adj.

5/Bordette (Canary) 6/Bordette (SB Emerald Green) 7/Bordette (Nile Green) 8/Bordette (Orange)

**
FL. 

Pref. 

Adj.

9/Bordette (Flame Red) 10/Bordette (White) 11/Bordette (Violet) 12/Kraft (Black)

THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

75 NORTH PACE BOULEVARD

PENSACOLA, FL 32505

BID TABULATION

Recommended Award

**
FL. 

Pref. 

Adj.

1/Bordette (Black) 2/Bordette (Azure Blue) 3/Bordette (Dark Blue) 4/Bordette (Brown)

Date:

Bid Number:

    Bid Title: 

170205

Art Paper



Bid Item #/Descripton

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F ARP Industries $27.87 $27.87 MO, 1 $32.57 $32.57 MO, 1 $25.90 $25.90 MO, 1 $32.57 $32.57 MO, 1

F DGS Educational Products $29.90 $29.90 MO, 2 $35.81 $35.81 MO, 2 $28.96 $28.96 MO, 2 $35.27 $35.27 MO, 2

F Pyramid School Products $27.56 $27.56 MO, 1 $32.45 $32.45 MO, 1 $25.80 $25.80 MO, 1 $32.49 $32.49 MO, 1

O School Specialty 5% $29.25 $30.71 $29.25 $30.71 $29.25 $30.71 $29.25 $30.71

O S&S Worldwide 5% NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

F Smith Office & Computer $27.76 $27.76 MO, 1 $32.45 $32.45 MO, 1 $25.80 $25.80 MO, 1 $32.45 $32.45 MO, 1

Bid Item #/Description 

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F ARP Industries $31.63 $31.63 MO, 1 $29.44 $29.44 MO, 1 $26.65 $26.65 MO, 1 $32.11 $32.11 MO, 1

F DGS Educational Products $33.48 $33.48 MO, 2 $31.44 $31.44 MO, 2 $28.12 $28.12 MO, 2 $34.31 $34.31 MO, 2

F Pyramid School Products $31.09 $31.09 MO, 1 $29.08 $29.08 MO, 1 $26.54 $26.54 MO, 1 $31.90 $31.90 MO, 1

O School Specialty 5% $29.25 $30.71 $29.25 $30.71 $29.25 $30.71 $29.25 $30.71

O S&S Worldwide 5% NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

F Smith Office & Computer $31.50 $31.50 MO, 1 $29.33 $29.33 MO, 1 $26.55 $26.55 MO, 1 $32.00 $32.00 MO, 1

Bid Item #/Descripton

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F ARP Industries $17.27 $17.27 MO, 1 $5.51 $5.51 MO, 1 $4.91 $4.91 MO, 1 $5.14 $5.14 MO, 1

F DGS Educational Products $26.00 $26.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

F Pyramid School Products $17.20 $17.20 MO, 1 $5.48 $5.48 MO, 1 $4.89 $4.89 MO, 1 $5.11 $5.11 MO, 1

O School Specialty 5% $16.60 $17.43 $3.95 $4.15 $4.90 $5.15 $4.90 $5.15

O S&S Worldwide 5% NO BID NO BID $6.01 $6.31 5 $6.01 $6.31 5 $5.88 $6.17 5

F Smith Office & Computer $17.20 $17.20 MO, 1 $5.48 $5.48 MO, 1 $4.89 $4.89 MO, 1 $5.11 $5.11 MO, 1

Bid Item #/Description 

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F ARP Industries $5.60 $5.60 MO, 1 $5.20 $5.20 MO, 1 $4.81 $4.81 MO, 1 $5.58 $5.58 MO, 1

F DGS Educational Products NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

F Pyramid School Products $5.55 $5.55 MO, 1 $5.02 $5.02 MO, 1 $4.80 $4.80 MO, 1 $5.55 $5.55 MO, 1

O School Specialty 5% $4.90 $5.15 $4.90 $5.15 $4.90 $5.15 $4.90 $5.15

O S&S Worldwide 5% $6.01 $6.31 5 $6.01 $6.31 5 $6.01 $6.31 5 $6.01 $6.31 5

F Smith Office & Computer $5.57 $5.57 MO, 1 $5.18 $5.18 MO, 1 $4.79 $4.79 MO, 1 $5.55 $5.55 MO, 1

**
FL. 

Pref. 

Adj.

17/Kraft (Pink) 18/Kraft (Red) 19/Kraft (White) 20/Kraft (Sky Blue)

**
FL. 

Pref. 

Adj.

13/Kraft (Dark Blue) 14/Kraft (Canary) 15/Kraft (Emerald Green) 16/Kraft (Orange)

**
FL. 

Pref. 

Adj.

25/18" Const. (Turquoise) 26/18" Const. (Holiday Red) 27/18" Const. (Red) 28/18" Const. (Magenta)

**
FL. 

Pref. 

Adj.

21/Kraft 24"  (Brown) 22/18"Const. (Holiday Green) 23/18"Const. (Yellow) 24/18"Const. (Violet)



Bid Item #/Descripton

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F ARP Industries $5.66 $5.66 MO, 1 $5.05 $5.05 MO, 1 $4.71 $4.71 MO, 1 $5.19 $5.19 MO, 1

F DGS Educational Products NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

F Pyramid School Products $5.63 $5.63 MO, 1 $5.02 $5.02 MO, 1 $4.68 $4.68 MO, 1 $5.16 $5.16 MO, 1

O School Specialty 5% $4.90 $5.15 $4.90 $5.15 $4.90 $5.15 $4.90 $5.15

O S&S Worldwide 5% $6.01 $6.31 5 $6.01 $6.31 5 $6.01 $6.31 5 $6.01 $6.31 5

F Smith Office & Computer $5.63 $5.63 MO, 1 $5.03 $5.03 MO, 1 $4.69 $4.69 MO, 1 $5.16 $5.16 MO, 1

Bid Item #/Description 

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F ARP Industries $4.41 $4.41 $5.70 $5.70 $4.87 $4.87 $5.07 $5.07

F DGS Educational Products NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

F Pyramid School Products $4.40 $4.40 MO, 1 $5.66 $5.66 MO, 1 $4.84 $4.84 MO, 1 $5.04 $5.04 MO, 1

O School Specialty 5% $4.90 $5.15 $4.90 $5.15 $4.90 $5.15 $4.90 $5.15

O S&S Worldwide 5% $5.88 $6.17 5 $6.01 $6.31 5 $6.01 $6.31 5 $6.01 $6.31 5

F Smith Office & Computer $4.40 $4.40 MO, 1 $5.67 $5.67 MO, 1 $4.85 $4.85 MO, 1 $5.05 $5.05 MO, 1

Bid Item #/Descripton

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F ARP Industries $4.88 $4.88 MO, 1 $4.97 $4.97 MO, 1 $5.66 $5.66 MO, 1 $2.49 $2.49 MO, 1

F DGS Educational Products NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

F Pyramid School Products $4.87 $4.87 MO, 1 $4.95 $4.95 MO, 1 $5.63 $5.63 MO, 1 $2.48 $2.48 MO, 1

O School Specialty 5% $4.90 $5.15 $4.90 $5.15 $4.90 $5.15 $2.21 $2.32

O S&S Worldwide 5% $6.01 $6.31 5 $6.01 $6.31 5 $6.01 $6.31 5 $2.50 $2.63 6

F Smith Office & Computer $4.86 $4.86 MO, 1 $4.95 $4.95 MO, 1 $5.63 $5.63 MO, 1 $2.49 $2.49 MO, 1

Bid Item #/Description 

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F ARP Industries $2.49 $2.49 MO, 1 $2.28 $2.28 MO, 1 $2.61 $2.61 MO, 1 $2.16 $2.16 MO, 1

F DGS Educational Products NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

F Pyramid School Products $2.49 $2.49 MO, 1 $2.27 $2.27 MO, 1 $2.60 $2.60 MO, 1 $2.14 $2.14 MO, 1

O School Specialty 5% $2.21 $2.32 $2.21 $2.32 $2.21 $2.32 $2.21 $2.32

O S&S Worldwide 5% $2.50 $2.63 6 $2.50 $2.63 6 $2.50 $2.63 6 $2.50 $2.63 6

F Smith Office & Computer $2.49 $2.49 MO, 1 $2.26 $2.26 MO, 1 $2.40 $2.40 MO, 1 $2.15 $2.15 MO, 1

**
FL. 

Pref. 

Adj.

33/18" Const. (Black) 34/18" Const. (Assortment) 35/18" Const. (Warm Brown) 36/18" Const. (Gold)

**
FL. 

Pref. 

Adj.

29/18" Const. (Festive Green) 30/18" Const. (Pink) 31/18" Const. (Sky Blue) 32/18" Const. (Blue)

**
FL. 

Pref. 

Adj.

41/18" Const. (Brillant Lime) 42/18" Const. (Orange) 43/18" Const. (Green) 44/18" Const. (Gray)

**
FL. 

Pref. 

Adj.

37/18" Const. (Dark Brown) 38/18" Const. (Orange) 39/18" Const. (Brillant Lime) 40/18" Const. (Salmon)



Bid Item #/Descripton

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F ARP Industries $2.30 $2.30 MO, 1 $2.24 $2.24 MO, 1 $2.10 $2.10 MO, 1 $2.11 $2.11 MO, 1

F DGS Educational Products NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

F Pyramid School Products $2.28 $2.28 MO, 1 $2.23 $2.23 MO, 1 $2.09 $2.09 MO, 1 $2.10 $2.10 MO, 1

O School Specialty 5% $2.21 $2.32 $2.21 $2.32 $2.21 $2.32 $2.21 $2.32

O S&S Worldwide 5% $2.50 $2.63 6 $2.50 $2.63 6 $2.50 $2.63 6 $2.50 $2.63 6

F Smith Office & Computer $2.28 $2.28 MO, 1 $2.22 $2.22 MO, 1 $2.09 $2.09 MO, 1 $2.10 $2.10 MO, 1

Bid Item #/Description 

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F ARP Industries $1.95 $1.95 MO, 1 $1.84 $1.84 MO, 1 $1.56 $1.56 MO, 1 $1.84 $1.84 MO, 1

F DGS Educational Products NO BID NO BID $3.25 $3.25 $2.95 $2.95 $3.25 $3.25

F Pyramid School Products $1.94 $1.94 MO, 1 $1.83 $1.83 MO, 1 $1.55 $1.55 MO, 1 $1.83 $1.83 MO, 1

O School Specialty 5% $2.21 $2.32 6 $1.69 $1.77 $1.69 $1.77 $1.69 $1.77

O S&S Worldwide 5% $2.50 $2.63 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

F Smith Office & Computer $1.94 $1.94 MO, 1 $1.83 $1.83 MO, 1 $1.55 $1.55 MO, 1 $1.83 $1.83 MO, 1

Bid Item #/Descripton

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F ARP Industries $1.84 $1.84 MO, 1 $1.84 $1.84 MO, 1 $1.84 $1.84 MO, 1 $1.84 $1.84 MO, 1

F DGS Educational Products $3.25 $3.25 $3.25 $3.25 $3.25 $3.25 $3.25 $3.25

F Pyramid School Products $1.83 $1.83 MO, 1 $1.83 $1.83 MO, 1 $1.83 $1.83 MO, 1 $1.83 $1.83 MO, 1

O School Specialty 5% $1.69 $1.77 $1.69 $1.77 $1.69 $1.77 $1.69 $1.77

O S&S Worldwide 5% NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

F Smith Office & Computer $1.83 $1.83 MO, 1 $1.83 $1.83 MO, 1 $1.83 $1.83 MO, 1 $1.83 $1.83 MO, 1

Bid Item #/Description 

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F ARP Industries $1.71 $1.71 MO, 1 $1.78 $1.78 MO, 1 $1.96 $1.96 MO, 1 $2.87 $2.87 MO, 1

F DGS Educational Products $2.18 $2.18 A, NS $5.95 $5.95 $2.50 $2.50 A, NS $8.95 $8.95

F Pyramid School Products $1.69 $1.69 MO, 1 $1.78 $1.78 MO, 1 $1.88 $1.88 MO, 1 $2.86 $2.86 MO, 1

O School Specialty 5% $1.75 $1.84 $1.80 $1.89 $1.95 $2.05 $2.90 $3.05

O S&S Worldwide 5% NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

F Smith Office & Computer $1.70 $1.70 MO, 1 $1.77 $1.77 MO, 1 $1.95 $1.95 MO, 1 $2.86 $2.86 MO, 1

**
FL. 

Pref. 

Adj.

49/18" Const. (Bright White) 50/20" Tissue (Yellow) 51/20" Tissue (White) 52/20" Tissue (Red)

**
FL. 

Pref. 

Adj.

45/18" Const. (Pink) 46/18" Const. (Dark Brown) 47/18" Const. (Warm Brown) 48/18" Const. (Tan)

**
FL. 

Pref. 

Adj.

57/Tissue (Asst. Bright) 58/Tissue (Pomps) 59/Tissue (Asst. Transparent) 60/12" Fadeless (Duet)

**
FL. 

Pref. 

Adj.

53/20" Tissue (SB Purple) 54/20" Tissue (Orange) 55/20" Tissue (Green) 56/20" Tissue (Blue)



Bid Item #/Descripton

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F ARP Industries $3.56 $3.56 MO, 1 $12.34 $12.34 MO, 1 $26.64 $26.64 MO, 1 $2.85 $2.85 MO, 1

F DGS Educational Products $8.95 $8.95 $29.95 $29.95 $41.25 $41.25 $3.94 $3.94

F Pyramid School Products $3.55 $3.55 MO, 1 $12.29 $12.29 MO, 1 $26.55 $26.55 MO, 1 $2.65 $2.65 MO, 1

O School Specialty 5% $3.60 $3.78 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $2.65 $2.78 A, ANA

O S&S Worldwide 5% NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $3.37 $3.54 6

F Smith Office & Computer $3.55 $3.55 MO, 1 $12.28 $12.28 MO, 1 $26.53 $26.53 MO, 1 $2.84 $2.84 MO, 1

Bid Item #/Descripton

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F ARP Industries $7.19 $7.19 MO, 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $4.77 $4.77 MO, 1

F DGS Educational Products $11.40 $11.40 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $4.29 $4.29
A,S,SA, 

MO,3

F Pyramid School Products $7.16 $7.16 MO, 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $4.76 $4.76 MO, 1

O School Specialty 5% $7.25 $7.61 A, NS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $4.85 $5.09

O S&S Worldwide 5% $8.47 $8.89 7 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

F Smith Office & Computer $7.15 $7.15 MO, 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Bid Item #/Description 

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F ARP Industries $4.77 $4.77 MO, 1 $4.77 $4.77 MO, 1 $4.77 $4.77 MO, 1 $4.77 $4.77 MO, 1

F DGS Educational Products $4.29 $4.29
A,S,SA, 

MO,3
$4.29 $4.29

A,S,SA, 

MO,3
$4.29 $4.29

A,S,SA, 

MO,3
$4.29 $4.29

A,S,SA, 

MO,3

F Pyramid School Products $4.76 $4.76 MO, 1 $4.76 $4.76 MO, 1 $4.76 $4.76 MO, 1 $4.76 $4.76 MO, 1

O School Specialty 5% $4.85 $5.09 $4.85 $5.09 $4.85 $5.09 $4.85 $5.09

O S&S Worldwide 5% NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

F Smith Office & Computer NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Bid Item #/Descripton

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F ARP Industries $2.34 $2.34 MO, 1 $1.28 $1.28 MO, 1 $8.95 $8.95 MO, 1 $16.90 $16.90 MO, 1

F DGS Educational Products $3.59 $3.59 $1.99 $1.99 $6.49 $6.49 A, S, SA $16.25 $16.25

F Pyramid School Products $2.33 $2.33 MO, 1 $1.28 $1.28 MO, 1 $7.05 $7.05 MO, 1 $16.48 $16.48 MO, 1

O School Specialty 5% $2.40 $2.52 $1.20 $1.26 A, NS $8.99 $9.44 A, S, SA NO BID NO BID

O S&S Worldwide 5% $3.87 $4.06 9 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

F Smith Office & Computer $2.33 $2.33 MO, 1 $1.28 $1.28 MO, 1 $8.91 $8.91 MO, 1 $16.83 $16.83 MO, 1

**
FL. 

Pref. 

Adj.

65/Manila Paper 66/Tracing Paper 67/Watercolor Paper 68/Neon Color Paper (Red)

No Award No Award

**
FL. 

Pref. 

Adj.

61/12" Fadeless (All Purpose) 62/Newsprint 63/Drawing Paper 64/Finger Paint

**
FL. 

Pref. 

Adj.

73/Chart Tablet (24"x32") 74/Chart Tablet (24x16") 75/Board (Railroad) 76/Board (Poster, White)

**
FL. 

Pref. 

Adj.

69/Neon Color Paper (Yellow) 70/Neon Color Paper (Green) 71/Neon Color Paper (Orange) 72/Neon Color Paper (Pink)



Bid Item #/Description 

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F ARP Industries $6.21 $6.21 MO, 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

F DGS Educational Products $5.39 $5.39 A, S, SA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

F Pyramid School Products $5.49 $5.49 MO, 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

O School Specialty 5% $6.99 $7.34 A ,S, SA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

O S&S Worldwide 5% NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

F Smith Office & Computer $6.20 $6.20 MO, 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Bid Item #/Description 

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F ARP Industries NO BID NO BID

F DGS Educational Products NO BID NO BID

F Pyramid School Products NO BID NO BID

O School Specialty 5% NO BID NO BID

O S&S Worldwide 5% NO BID NO BID

F Smith Office & Computer NO BID NO BID

NOTES:

A       Alternate

ANA  Alternate Not Accepted

MO   Minimum Order

NS   No Sample 

S   Sample provided

SA   Sample Approved

SNA Sample Not Approved

1 Pacon Minimum Order $3000.00

2 Minimum Order 154  Rolls (Assortable)

3 Order in Multiples of 50 pkgs per color

4 Case pack only

5 Order in Multiples of 15 packs per color

6 Order in Multiples of 25 packs per color

7 Order in Multiples of 10 packs

8 Order in Multiples of 4 reams

9 Order in Multiples of 12

**
FL. 

Pref. 

Adj.

77/Board (Poster, Black) 78/Board (Mat, Gray/White) 79/Scratch Paper (Multi-Color) 80/Scratch Paper (Black)

No Award No Award No Award

No Award

**
FL. 

Pref. 

Adj.

81/Illustration Board (White)



BID TABULATION, RECOMMENDATIONS, AND PROTEST

Bid tabulations with award recommendations are posted for 72 hours in the Purchasing Department Office and are also posted to the 
School District's website address at: http://ecsd-fl.schoolloop.com/purchasing/bids.

Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in Section 120.57(3) Florida Statutes, and School Board Rules shall constitute a waiver 
of proceedings. Bid tabulations or recommendations will be distributed solely through the Purchasing website address. Notices will not 
be automatically mailed.

I hereby certify that the prices and bidders reflected herein are valid, and have been received in compliance to Escambia County School 
Board Rules and Florida Law.

John Dombroskie,
Director Purchasing Department


